PORT AUTHORITY OF GUAM
ATURIDAT I PUETTON GUAHAN
Jose D. Leon Guerrero Commercial Port

GOVERNMENT OF GUAM
1026 Cabras Highway, Suite 201
Piti, Guam 86925 Telephone: (671) 477-5931/35
FELIX P. CAMACHO (671) 477-2683/65
Gover;tor of Guam Facsimile: {671) 477-2689/4445
Webpage: www.portofguam.com
MICHAEL W. CRUZ
‘Lieutenant Governor

November 27, 2007

Ms. Doris Flores Brooks

Public Auditor '

Office of the Public Auditor
Suite 401, Pacific News Building
238 Archbishop Flores Street
Hagatna, Guam 96910

Dear Ms. Brooks:

Pursuant to your letter dated November 20, 2007 addressed to Ms. Anita T. Cruz,
Acting Assistant Chief Procurement Officer, transmitted is an original and two (2) copies
_,) of procurement records for GSA/PAG07-006 Item #4.1 — 40,000# Forklifi.
N Should you have any questions, please contact this office. %

Sincerely,

g
. " -)(‘_/
KENNETH T. TAGAWA

D\/ General Manager

Enclosure

cc: Mr. John Limtiaco, Far East Equipment Company LLC

Acting Asst. Chief Procurement Officer, GSA RECEIVED
Lujan, Aguigui & Perez, LLC OFFICE OF THE PUBLIC AUDITOR
PAG Supply Management Administrator PROCTIREMENT * PPATS
' NOV 27 2001
TII\EF;:_-L!‘ W RMI
BY: J. (™

FILE No. opa.ps, (J7—0[0

v - ORIGINAL

The Port Autherity of Guam, Jese I, Leon Guerrere Commercial Port is an Equal Employment Opportunity Employer.
- Complaints of discrimination should be sent to the Humuan Resources Division.



Theresa Gumataotao
Note
NOTE: Not all procurement documents are attached. The complete procurement record re OPA-PA-07-010 is available for public view at the Office of the Public Auditor. Pls. contact 475-0390. 
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Procurement Record
For Invitation for Bid
GSA PAGO07-006
For Five (5) Each 11,000 Lbs; Two (2) Each 16,000
Lbs; One (1) Each 20,000 Lbs; and One (1) Each
40,000 Lbs Fork trucks for Jose D. Leon Guerrero
Commercial Port of Guam
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Far East Equipment
Company LLC
Bid Offer



I | | PORT AUTHORITY OF GUAM( | _; .
. ATURIDAT ¥ PUETTON GUAHAN
Jose D. Leon Guerrero Commercial Port

GOVERNMENT OF GUAM

1026 Cabras Highway, Suite 201
Piti, Guam 96925 Telephone (671) 477-5931/35

FELIX P. CAMACHO (671) 477-2683/85
Gavemor of Guam ) : ' ' , Facsimile: (671) 477-2689/4445

: ‘ 0 R‘ G ‘ NAL : _ Webpage: www.portofguam.com
MICHAEL W. CRUZ .

Lieutenant Governor

* INVITATION FOR BID

GSA PAG 07-006

The Jose D. Leon Guerrero Commercial Port (“Port Authority of Guam™), a public
corporation and an Autonomous Agency of the Goverriment of Guam, is soliciting bids
to purchase Five (5) Each, 10,000-11,0001bs, Two (2) Each 14,000-16,0001bs, One
Each 20,000 1bs, and One (1) Each 40,000 1bs Fork Trucks.

All interested parties may pick up copies of the Invitation for Bid at the Commercial

- Port Procurement Office located at 1026 Cabras Highway, Suite 201, Piti, Guam

(\_) 96915 or at the General Services Agency (GSA) anytime from Monday through Fnday
(excluding hohdays) between 8:00A.M. to 5:00 P.M.

Bid Opening will be held at General Services Agency (GSA), 10:00a.m. Chamorro
Standard Time, July 26, 2007.

A pre-bid conference is schedule for 2:00 P.M., Guam Time on July 17, 2007 at the
General Services Agency Conference Room. A non-refundable fee of $25.00
(U.S.Dollars) will be charged in the form of cash, cashier’s or certified check made
payable to Jose D. Leon Guerrero Commercial Port for a bid package.

This announcement is paid with Government Funds by the Jose D. Leon Guerrero Commercial Port

s £ S Voo

/s/ PEDRO F. SAN NICOLAS
Acting Assistant Chief Procurement Officer

S

The Par!Aumnmy of Guam, Jose D, Leon Guerrero Commercial Port is on Equal Emplayment Opportunity Ensployer.
Campfainu aof discrimination skould be sent to the Human Resources Divislon.



PORT AUTHORITY OF GUAM
ATURIDAT I PUETTON GUAHAN
Jose D. Leon Guerrero Commercial Port

GOVERNMENT OF GUAM
1028 Cabras Highway, Suite 201 ’
Piti, Guam 96925 Telephone: (671) 477-5931/35
FELIX P. CAMACHO (671) 477-2683/85
Goverr'!or of Guam ’ Facsimile: {(671) 477-2685/4445
Webpage: www.portofguam.com
MICHAEL W. CRUZ . :
Lieutenant Governor
THIS ADVERTISEMENT IS PAID WITH GOVERNMENT FUNDS BY:
Port Authority of Guam
BID INVITATION
Bid No. PAG 07-006
For Five (5) Ea. 10,000-11,0001bs, Two (2) Ea. 14,000-16 s0001bs, .
One (1) Ea. 20,0001bs. and One (1) Ea. 40,0001bs. FORK
TRUCKS
Pre-Conference Date:  July 17, 2007 Time: 2:00 p.m.
Bid Opening Date: July 26, 2007 Time: 10:00 a.m.
() Place: . GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY, PITI, GUAM

Procarement Office

INTERESTED PARTIES MAY PICK UP BID
FORMS/SPECIFICATIONS AT SAID PLACE
A non-refundable fee of $25.00 will be charged for each Bid Package

PEDRO F. SAN NICOLAS
Acting Assistant Chief Procurement Officer

The Part Authority of Guum, Jose D\ Loon Guerrero Commercial Fort is an Equal Employment Opportunily Employer.
Complainiz of discrimination skould be vent ta the Hunml Reoources Dln‘:bu.



INVITATION FOR BID

® - - ISSUING OFFICE:
A Port Authority of Guam
Qﬂw E QW\ ﬂw&, GENERAL SERVICE AGENCY
' GOVERNMENT OF GUAM
148 ROUTE 1 MARINE DRIVE
Chief Procurement Officer PITI, GUAM 96325
Acting Assistamt
]_—“—ﬁ-—*—*

DATE ISSUED: BID INVITATION NO.:  07-006

BIDFOR: Five (5) Each 10,000-11,000 1bs, Two (2) Each 14,000-16,000 1bs,
One (1) Each 20,000 1bs and One (

_ 1) Each 40,000 1bs Fork Trucks
SPECIFICATION: Please refer to pages 2a thr '

ough 2¢,
DESTlNATION: dose ]@utnggtguggrggg,.,_(}omercial Port of Guam

HEQU|RED DELNEHY DATE: Refer to delivery dates on attachments

TNSTRUCTION TO BIDDERS:

INDIGATE WHETHER: . [] INDIVIDUAL [ PARTNERSHIP [] CORPORATION

') | vcoRPoRATED IN-

This Bid shall be submitted in duplicate and sealed to the issuing office above no
later than (Time) 10: {Datae) ¢+ and shall be publicly opeaned.
Bid submitted after t and date spec shall be rejected. See attached
Ganaral Terss and Conditions, and Sealed Bid Solicitation for detaile.

within the times specified, the articles
and services at the price stated opposite the respactive items listed on the schedule
Provided, unless otherwise specified by the bidder. 1In considaration to the expsase
Go ‘ ating, and evaluating this and other bids, “amnd
othar considerations, the undersignad agrees that this bid remain firm and nmln
' : from the date opening to supply any or all of the items

" which prices are quoted.

NAME AND ADDRESS OF BIDDI.%R: SIGNATURE AND TITLE OF PERSON
' AUTHORIZED TQ'SIGN THIS BID:
Far East Equipment Company LLC

P.0. Box Box 10838

Tamuning, Guam 96931

),

|AWAFID: CONTRACT NO.: AMOUNT: _DATE:

ITEM NOIS) -AWARNEN.




Morrico Equipment LLC
Bid Offer

»
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““ PORT AUTHORITY OF GUAM >

ATURIDAT I PUETTON GUAHAN | ,
Jose D. Leon Guerrero Commercial Port* - &
GOVERNMENT OF GUAM. = . 5.0

1026 Cabras Highway, Suite 201 -
Piti, Guam 86925 . Telephone: (671} 477-5931/3:

{671) 477-2683/8!
Facsimile: (671) 477-2680/444¢
Webpage: www.portefguam;.cor

4 . TNy
] .

FELIX P. CAMACHO
Govemor of Guam

rzr MICHAEL W. CRUZ

= Lieutenant Governor

INVITATION:FOR BID

GSA PAG 07-006

tay

The Jose D. Leon Guerrero Commercial Port (“Port Authority of Guam™), a public
corporation and an Autonomous Agency of the Governiment of Guam, is soliciting bids
to purchase Five (5) Each, 10,000-1 1,0001Ibs, Tvo (2) Each 14,000-16,000 Ibs, One
Each 20,000 Ibs, and One (1) Each 40,000 1bs Fork Trucks. :

All interested parties may pick up copies of the Invitation for Bid at the Commercial

Port Procurement Office located at 1026 Cabras Highway, Suite 201, Piti, Guam
[Q 96915 or at the General Services Agency (GSA) anytime from Monday through Friday

(excluding holidays) between 8:00A.M. to 5:00 P.M. '

Bid Opening will be held at General Services Agency (GSA), 10:00a.m. Chamorro
Standard Time, July 26, 2007. ‘

A pre-bid conference is schedule for 2:00 P.M., Guam Time on July 17, 2007 at the

General Services Agency Conferenice Room. A non-refindable fee of $25.00
(U.S.Dollars) will be charged in the form of cash, cashier’s or certified check made \
payable to Jose D. Leon Guerrero Commercial Port for a bid package.

This announcement is paid with Government Funds by the Jose D. Leon Guerrero Commercial Port

Bdis £ o Nidhe

/s/ PEDRO F. SAN NICOLAS
Acting Assistant Chief Procurement Officer

The Port Authoiity of Guam, Jose . Leon Guerrero Commercial Portis an Equal Emplayment Opportunity Emplayer,
Complaints of discrimination should be sent to the Human Resoxrces Division, :




o | INVITATION FOR BID

. -  ISSUING OFFICE:
Y Port Authority of Guam
Q(ﬁw E %M )? wéa GENERAL SERVICE AGENCY
’ GOVERNMENT OF GUAM
148 ROUTE 1 MARINE DRIVE
%
DATE ISSUED:

BID INVITATIONNO.: 07006

BIDFOR: Five (5) Each 10,000-11,000 1bs, Two (2) Each 14,000-16,000 1bs,
. One (1) Each 20,000 1bs and One (1) Each 40,000 1bs Fork Trucks
SPECIFICATION: Please refe

T to pages 2a through 2t. '
DESTINATION:  jose R cheon: Guerrero. Commercial Port of Guam

REQUlHEDDEUVERYDQTE: Refer to delivery dates on aﬁtachments
INDICATE WHETHER:
INCORPORATED IN:

- [ INDIVIDUAL [] PARTNERSHIP [7] CORPORATION
i\ \Lided \.\‘Abiﬁ)tv\ QO‘*QWV\
This Bid shall be submitted in duplicate and

ssaled to the issuing ott;l.c- above no
later than (Time) 10:000: {Date) « and shall be publicly openad.
Bid submitted after and date soneT At s

shall be rejected.
Genaral Yerms and Conditions, and Sealed Bid Solicitation for details.

&grees to furnish within the time specified, the articles
and services at the price stated oppoajite the xeapactive items listed on the schadule
provided, unless otharwise specified by the bidder. In consideration to the
of the Government in opaning, tabulating, and evaluat ’

. igned agress that this bid remain firm and irrevocable
within 60 - cplendar days from the

date to s any or all of the ltems
which pETces are quoted. °pening to supply any

SIGNATURE AND TITLE OF PERSON
AUTHORIZED TO SIGN THIS BID:

Crerernal MErinooen

—

AWARD: CONTRACT NO.:65A-PAG-07-006  AMOUNT 920,391.00

DATE: ocT 01, 2007
ITEM NO@ AWARDED: 1-1. Five(5) 11,0001bs 1.3 Three(3) 20,0001bs 1.4 One (1) 40,09011:5
. - . . '

MORRICO EQUIPMENT LLC | : < T

Tamuning Guam 96913 CHIEF PHQCUREMENT OFF ER
) : _Acting Asgistant . :
NAME AND ADDRESS OF CONTRAGCTOR: SIGNATURE AND TITLEOF P N

. AUTHORIZED TO SIGN THIS CONTRACT:

i

| MOERICD G
DRERICL)




(Ahenslan Setbision Hinirad
Government of Guam

: .
T

Accountability . Impartiality | o

Competence  » Opllm.u ..

Value

e o ——

INVITATION FOR BID (IFB) NO.: 07-006
DESCRIPTION: Five (5) Ea. 10,000-11,000 1bs, Two (2) Ea. 14,000-165000 1bs
One (1) Ea. 20,000 1bs and One (1) Ea. 40,000 Ibs Fork Trucks

SPECIAL RENINDER TO PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS
Bidders are reminded to read the Sealed Bid Solicitation and
Instructions, and General Terms and Conditions attached to the IFB
to ascertain that all of the following requirements checked below
are submitted in the bid envelope, in duplicate, at the date and
time for bid opening. ' . .

BID GUARANTEE (1xy nv .. - Ma in the :
{xx) ﬁ mmhglszﬁgn losis Y be in the form of;
Cashier's Chack or.Certified Check
b. Letter of Credit

c. Surety Bond - Valid only if accompanied by:

1. Current Certificate of Authority issued by the Insurance
Commissioner; :

B Power of Attorney issued by the Surety to the Resident
General Agent;

3.  Power of Attorney issued
the Surety to whoever ism

( ) STATEMENT OF QUALIFICATIONS;
( ) SAMPLES;

by two (2) major officers of
signing on their behalf,

(=x ) BROCHURES/DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE;

(== ) AFFIDAVIT OF DISCLOSURE OF MAJOR SHAREHOLDERS - Must comply
with the following requirements: )

a. The affidavit must be notarixed and dated on the same month as the
bia oponi.ng: . ™

5. Date of signature of the person mdthorized to sign the bid and the
. notary date must be the same. ' :

o) YRR . RSB R MR, (S8 S
(xx) OTHER REQUIREMENTS: | P :
1. Non-Collysion Affidavit

2, JInsurance Coverage upon_award 2. Nop-Gratuity Affidavir
3. Good Standing Affidavit 6. Special Provisions (Pg.1Qmo£119)

This reminder must be signed and returned in the bid envelope
together with the bid.

Failure to comply with the above
requirements will mean a disqualiﬂcati_on and rejection of the bid.

‘ WADT
on. this 22 & -day. of GCV“‘L‘—U(KC ‘ o an,
I, ‘Y{wq!ga,\,., Skt -

» authorized representative of

WNovag Eﬁu_«%?v_qzi. ey acknowledge receipt of this

special reminder to prospective bildders with the above referenced
IFB. .

Bidder Regresentative's Signature

DOA' 132

< ’ T



A R GOVERNMENTOFGUAM
\ : L GENEHALTEHMS ANDCONDITIONS

SEALED BID SOLICITATION AND AWAFID

Only those Boxes checked balow ar‘e appuc‘able 10 this bid,

J AUTHOHITY This solicitation is issued subjoct foallthe prowsnon of the Guam Procuromonl Act ISGGA Chaplor 5)and

~ the Guam Procurnmont Hogulauons (coplns of both are.available at the Office of the Compiler of Laws, Department of Law,

copies available for inspection at General Services Agoncy) It requires III partm Involvad in tho Propamb‘n. nogmiation.
: podormanm. or ldmamsiralmn of conlracts Io actin good Ianh .

a/ 2 GENERAL INTENTION Unlus othorwnso specitied, itis the daclarad and acknowledgndmlomlan and meaning of these

. . General Terms and Conditions for the bidder 1o provide the Gavernment of Guam (Govarnmant) with spocm.d services
-.or wnh rnatonais. supphos or equupmem compl lnly assomblad and rndy foruse. = - ‘ :

3. TAXES Blddnrs are caitiohed’ that they are subjnct 1o Guam Income Taxos as wall as  all other taxes on Guam
Transactions. Specific information an taxos may be obtamed Irom the Dlroclor oi Revenue and Taxahon

{4. LICENSING Bidders are caumned lhat tha Government wnll not COI'ISIdOf Ior award any offer. subrnmed bya b|ddor who
' has_not complied with the Guam Licensing Law. Specmc mfnrmanon on licenses may be obtalnad 1rom the Dlmctor ol

M/ Revenus and Taxation. _‘ : o _ |
LOCAL PROCUFIEMENT PREFERENCE All procuremant of supphos and services. whata posmblo will ba made from
among busmosses icensed to: do busmass on ‘Guam in:accordance:with Section 5008 of tho Guam Pmcuremenl Act

(_/\ " (SGCA, Chapior S)yand Socmn 1 -104 of the Guam Procuramem Hegulanons

6. COMPLIANCE WI'I' I'I SPECIFICATIONS AND OTHER SOLICITATION HEQUIREMENTS B|ddsrs shall comply with
all specrhcatlons and othar rnqmremonts oI the Sohcnauon :

Q '7. “ALL OR NONE" BIDS Unloss otherwnse allowed under this. Sollcnatron. III of none” blds may be desmad to bo non-
responsive, If thn bad IS S0 IImnod the Govornment may rejecl part of such proposal and award on the ramalndar

. NOTE: Bychockmgthu ltom. tho Govarnmom is raquosung aII oI the' bld nnmslo be b|ddod ornone, at aII Tho Govornmont
wlllnut u\nrd un ln Itomlzcd hnls Fleterence Sacmn 3 301 06 of. lha Guam Procuremem Rogulauons

LW

8. INDEPENDENT PRICE DETERMINATION Tha blddnr. upon smnmg 1ha Imntahnn for B:d I:amhns that the prices in his
bid ware derived at without collusion, and acknowledge that collusion and anti-compalitive practicas are prohibited.by law.
\Violations will be subject o lho.provusion of Section 565 1:of that of the Guam.Procurement Act. Other existing civil, criminal
-or: admimstratm requ 3 unpaued and may bn in addmon ln the ronﬁﬂ in Soctmn 5551 of lho Governmant

ST

t\mll qonsndnr nol moro than two {2) (Bamc lnd Altumate) iteamn pncos and tho bidder

|f. supphes atonals tqunprnnnt lndlpr :pocmld services ofierad comply. with specifications
c! _ngm N Whero bas:cor allarnate bid meets the. minimum required specification, cost and other factors will
* be'considered. Failure tp ‘expiain this requirement wm result in rejection of the bid.

‘ 10. BID ENVELOPE Envobpo shaII bo sealed and ma‘rked with the bidder's name, Bid numbcr time, dan and place of Bid

_ BID GUARANTEE REOUIHEMENT Biddor is roqunod Io subrml a Bld Guaramn Bond or: standby lrrovocabh Letter
Q "of Credit. or cartlhod Chock or; Cuhxor‘a Chackin'the same bid.envelope o be heid by the Government pending award.
The Bid Guarantee Bond Latter of Credit, Certified Chaeck or Cashier's Check mustbe. issued by any local surety or banking :
_, inslitution licensed 10.do business on Guam and mado payablatothe Treasurer of Gisam inthe amouint ofmmm 15%
. of hig highas! total bad ‘offer., The Bid Bond must be submitted.an Gavernment Standard- Form-BB-1.(Copy enciosed).
Personal Checks will not be aouplod as Bid Guarantes:: i a successiul Bidder (contractor) withdrawa from the bid or tails
1o anter into contract vmhun the prescribad time, such Bid guarantes will be forleited tothe Government of Guam, ‘Bids will
.be dnqullliid I nol.accompanied by:Bid. Bond, Llﬂlrd crodit. conihod Chock or Cuhm'l Chaik:. Blddor musl include

_,bf AtlornoyjndLCnrtmcatc,pInAmhmny onthe. luraty is: cauu for rejection of bid

PURSUANT: OF IC LAW 27-127,ALL COMPETITIVE SEALED BIDDING FOR PROCUREMENT OF

LIES i& ﬁ%ﬁ’mm:m%.m, & 15‘ BIb SECIRITY OF%TIE Tﬂ'l'AL BID llIST mm BiD
_, MANCE B'OND;FIEGEUINE“ENT:z The Bidﬂor;may-bbreﬁuirid:to-!.urnish a Perdormance Bond on Government
o ”Slandard qrm BB-1.or standby irrevocable Letterof Craditor.Cartified Check or Cashnr‘sChockpayabloto the Treasurer
, oI Guam mued by any: of the- Iocal Banks or Bondlng Insmutton inthe arnount oqual to L

porcom ( -x.) of lho oontract pnoos as ucunty for the: fauhiul podurmanoo and praper Iumllmom of the
contract. Inthe eventthat any of the provisions of this contract are violated by the contractor, the Chief Procuremant Officer
shall sarve written notice upon both-the contractor dnd:the Surety-of.its: intanuon to terminate the.contract. Unless
mmaetory mlngomonl or correclion is mado within Ion (10) days of such notice the contract shall censs and terminate

upon the expiration of the ten (10) days. In the evem ol any ‘such termination, the Chief Procurement Officer shal
immadiately serve notice thereof upon the Surety, The Surety shait hava the right to take over and perform the contract,
provided, however, that it the Surety does not commence pcrformance thereof within 10 days Irorn the date ok the maulmg




+

of notice of tarmination, the G ent may take ovar and prosecute the same f«""" phu the contract or fo !

. ree wccoust -
for the account and at the expense of the contractor, and the contractor and his Surety shall be liabie to the @gmmn:: §n
for any excess cost occasioned the Govemmaent theteby (GPR Socuon 3-202.03.4). )

g ="
3/13. PERFORMANCE GUARANTEE: Bidders who are awarded a contract under this solicitation, guarantes that goods will |

be delivered or required services performed within the time specified. Failure to parformthe cantractin a satistactory manner
may be cause for suspension or debarment from doing business with the Govemmant and 1o enforcs Section 12 of thase

General Terms and Conditions. In addition, the Governmaent will hold the Vendor liable and wili ent h
/ . as se! forth in Section 41 of these General Terms and Conditions. oree the Tequirements
14

SURETY BONDS: B8id and Performance Bonds coverage must be signed or countersigned in Guam by a foreign or alien
sursty’s resident general agent. The Surety must be an Insurance Company, authorized by the Government of Guam and

qualifiedto do business in Guam. Bids will be disqualified i the Surety Company does not have avalid Cartiticate of Authority
trom the Governmant of Guam to conduct busin.ss in Guam,
2)/15.

COMPETENCY OF BIDDERS: Bids will be considered only from the such bidders who, inthe opinnn olthe Govlmmcm
/ can show evidence of their ability, oxpcmnoo. nqmpmum. and Iacilties to render satistactory sarvice.
16.

DETERMINATION OF RESPONSIBILITY OF BIDDERS:. The Chie! Procurement Officer reserves the right for securing

from bidders information to determine whather or not they are responsible and to inspact plant site, place of business: and
supplies and services as necessary to determine thmr rosponsibilny in accordance with Section 15 ofthese Ganaeral Terms
and Condhions (GPR Section 3-401) ‘

EK?.

STANDARD FORDETERMINATION OF LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER: Indeterminingthe lowest tuponslblo o!(or
the Chief Procurement Officar shallbe. gmdod by the following:
a) Price of itams offered.
b}  The ability, capacity, and skill of the Biddet to perform.
c)  Whaether the Bidder can parform promptly or within the specified time.
d)  The quality of parformanca of the Bidder with regards to-awards praviously made to him,
®) The previous and exisiing compliance by the Bidder with laws and regulations r-lat:ve to procurement. -
1}  The sufficiency of the financial resources and sbility of the Bidder to perform. ) U
@)  The ability of the bidder to provide future maintenance and services for th. subject of the nward
h)  The compliance with ail of the conditions to:the Solicitation. -

l?.é

TIEBIDS: Hihe blds are for the same unit price or tota! amount in the whole or in part, the Chief Procurement Officer witt
determine award based on Section 3.202.15.2, or o reject all such bids (GPF! Section 3-202.15.2).
2/19.

BRAND NAMES: Any nferonoo in thn Solicitation to manufactunr‘s Brand Names and number is due to lack of a
satisiactory specification of commodity description.’ Such preference is intended to be deacriptive, but nor restrictive and
for the sole purpose of indicating prospective bidders & description of the article or services that will be satisfactory. Bids

on comparable items will be considerad pro\ndod lhl blddef claarly states in his bid tho exact articles ha is offering and hc\v
R differs from the. p;mnll spocﬂncahon oo

2. DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE Dcscrpnw litoraturu(s) as spacified-in thls solickation must be furnished as a part of the
bid and must be.received at the date andtime st for opening Bids, Tha fitarature fumished must clearly identity the item(s)
inthe Bid. The descriptive Iteratlre is required to establish, forthe purposs of valuation and award, details of the product(s)
the bidder proposes 10 furnish including design, materials, components, performance characteristics, methods of manulac-
ture, construction, assembly or ather charatteristics which are considered appropriate. Rcio:tiondtho Bid will be required
if the descriptive literature(s) do not show thatthe product(s) offered conform(s) to the spacifications and other requiremants

of this solicitation. Failure to furnish the doscripﬂvo Irloraturo(s) hy ll\o llmo spoeiﬁod in the Soimimwill require rejection
of the bid.

T 21. SAMPLES: Sample(s)of item(s) as specilied in this solicitation must be furnished as a part of the bid and mustbe received
st the date and time set for opening Bids. The sample(s} should represant exactly what the Biider proposes fo furnish and
will be used 10 determine i the kem(s) offered compliss with the specifications. Rsjection of the Bid wil be required i the
sampie(s) do not show that the product(s) offerred conform(s)tothe mclliuﬁum andother rnqulnmnholtlﬂuohchlbn
Faiture to fumish the sampie(s) hy the time. spodhod in 1h| Solicltatlon will require rejection of the Bid. ‘ Q

Q 22. LABORATORY-TEST: Sucooulul bidder s roquh-od 1o accompany delivery of his goods with a Laboratory Test Report

) hdlclungthltthop:nducthohmmhmngthoeonmmommmwhthomm This report is on the bidder's
aomumﬂ\dmuubom;unl‘thmMAuodubn - :

l?.l/u.

AWAHD CANOELLATIGI&REJECHN' Awudohalboundﬂolhlunﬂmbhmd mpomlnblddor whose
bid js determined i be the most advantageous tothe G:mrnrmm nldnglmu comadontbntho wmqbnmmhnh
in-this solicitation:” Noothufmsorukoﬂnshalibouudhthaﬂaumhn ‘Tha'right is’ roumd as the interest of the
Government may require. _fipq‘wﬁ% any ! minor-iregularity in bids received. The Chiel Procurement Officar-shiall have the
luﬂmllytomrd Gandel,or rejectbids, /Inwholeorinpaitfor anyonecr moreitems  hedetermines itis inthe public interest,
) lqtpd.h,ﬂuw resonsible biddorwﬂhin tha specitied lime for-accoptance as: indicatad intho solicRation, results
“”ln Bidding contract without furthier action by sither party. In case of an arror in the extension of prices, unk price will govern.
lthtlnpo!icyalthoeoummmbmwwquulmcd balbiddon The Govermnment reservesthe righttoincrease

ordmmthcquam&ydﬂummﬁormudandmd«addi!nnalmudﬂorthoumotypoﬂomundthownqum

: bnuchmdlhlmandadditiumlmrdsbtudomhobldpriouforap«bdominy(m)daynmrmiglndm No
sward shall be made under this solicitation which shall muwoMmmeimwubhldhrdundlhmﬂn
government (GPR Section 3-202, 14.1) :

{2‘. HAHKIIG Elchouummm:hallbomamodwhhmowrdtmm«numbﬂ Rem number, brief ltem description
and quantty, Latwr marking shafl not ba leat than /4" in height.
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M- 25 scmm& ful bidder shall notify the General Sorvices Agency, Telophono Nos, 475-1707 or ..
Vo~ ATST13, ot Roust tweaty-fouir (24) boirs befure delivery of any iemn uader thin solictation, |
A R _
1%, BuL orm“m&amﬂn ' ,:_wlwmmomtummwmummmEa‘x\mwm\ymm
Q ﬁ:l.mm iy m&ﬂlm mBﬂlodeemummyhxmdehmudlm

. ‘ s y .“ h ¥ . ) .
. mmﬁmm_wgwmmﬂmmm@nmmmm
B2 MANUFACTURER'S CERTIFICATE: Snocesstia bidder is roquired, upon dolivery of any item uader this

. furnish a cetificate fmmﬂnmaml‘m:mmdmmn that the goods mect the ¢ y with fis

9. \ LQUIREMENTS: The G will oaly considor Bids on motor vehicles which
. omply with the requireasizsita of the National Traffic and Motor Veicle safoty Act of 1966 (Public Law 89-563) and, Cleen
| Aﬁm_um@ub&_uws&mxmmmplimbhmcmBiddm_mmimeequipmmqfﬁmdepmply
_with these aforomentioncd Foderl Laws. - e
[30. SAFETY INSPECTION: All motor vehicles delivered under this contract must pass the Govemment of Guam Vehicle
[451. GUARANTEE: -
a) Gumluecf\hhidn'l‘ypdlqulp-nt:

PN
I3

NN . puﬁ:.umnnoe.ﬁrlpu-hdofmtlmthmom

b) Guarantee of Other Type of Equipment: _ . o ) -
mnmﬁﬂbﬁh'ﬁﬂ-_maﬂmhmofqﬁmoﬁud.mﬁnumﬁmdm31-.above.qmmdcfecu_ve
plm.whnnmbip,lndpu:hmnocﬁnrlpuiodofnﬁluuhﬁm@)qon&tlﬁud&of;ﬂpﬁg{g_qqulﬁmt Bidder shal}
.l.)_ ‘ -l v hu - |h“mm(3) q ﬂa!ﬁ pil . i 5 .f . .
repiaced by the Contractor without cost to the Government * Repairs, adj

mmplmdhy&emumwiﬁhﬁx(ﬁ)wﬁngdapnﬂumﬁoﬁ. g ‘

/@ Compliance with this Section is a condition of thia Bid, £330, -

[132. REPRESENTATION REGARDING ETHICS IN PUBLIC F [ENTSThe:t or%onmsctorrepmmuﬂm it
hunotknowinglyh:ﬂtmadmdpmmimthuitwﬂlmtknowinglyinﬂtmg vernment employee to breach any of the
othicalmndudiundmmtlmithnnotvioh&ed,ismviohﬁng,mdptomisuthuitwillmtviommepmhibiﬁon
mmmmmuMmmllmmmmcmwofmemmmmmm
Chapter 11 of the Guam Procurement i

1S, REPRESENTATION REGARDING CONTIN

GENT FEES: 'Iheconmtotreprelmuthuithasmtmtﬁnedap«sonto
mhmtmmm»aﬁommmmmmwor

understanding for a commission, percentage, brokerage, or
wuﬁngentﬁoc,ueeptfwmﬁmofbmnﬁdeemphymwbmﬁdembﬁabodmmﬁciﬂ sclling agencies for the
Ppurpose of securing business (GPR Section 11-207). . ‘

[“135. COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS Bidders awarded a contract under this Solicitation shall comply with the applicable
standard, provigions, and stipulations of all i Fedualmdlorlocdhw:,mlu,mdwguhﬁommht_ivetothe
Performance of this contract and the fumishing of goods. : P .‘

r]{cmcxbnnm: mmmmm.mmmﬁmwwmmnbuﬁmjmwmdmmmm

. with the pepvisions of Soction 6:101-03:1 07 the G Procurement Regulationa: & 1 | ,

[ésmrwonxonpm- Any stop woek: onde issued relative 1o awands made under this solicitation will be subject 1o and in
mdmwimﬂwmoﬁgjmofsmnﬁ-wl-m.lofﬁn&amhomm llations.

[“138. TERMINATION FOR CONVENIENCE:

the Purchase Onder (from the date Purchase Order is acknowledged by vendor), then the contractor is in default, Defaults will .
bo treated subject to and in accondance with the provisions of Section 6-101-08 of the Gaam Pra

wemant Damlesso— -



- W S M RS R TR Y WP AR B

. - - . e uwuu:-v-wu-wu\n:m:-m-umm .;~¢im‘|m ‘ .
delivered to their destination or regfi mrmdudm&mhuumu% numaﬁﬁm& "
specificd delivery date, he is required to notify the Chief Procurement Offices of mch delay. Notification shafl be ia, writing - -
and shall be receive by the Chief Procurement Officer at least twenty-four (24):hours before tho specified delivery datz, . =
Notification of delay shall include an explanation of the causes and reasons for the delay including statement(s) from sopplier
or shipping company causing the dolay. Tho Govermment reeerves the right to reject delay justification if, in the opinion'of th(
Chief Procurement Officer, such justification is not adequate. :
~
41, LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: When the contractor is given notice of delay or nonperforménce as specified in Paragraph 1
(Default) of the Tormination for Defsult Clause of this contract and fails to cure in the time specified, the contractor shall be
lisble for damages for delay in the amount of one-fourth of one percent (1%) of cutstanding onder per calendar day from date
sct for cure until either the territory reasonable obtains similar supplies or services if the contractor is terminated for defanlt, or
mﬁlﬂanvﬁuhmpplhmmiﬂhcmmhmemm To the extent that the
contractor’s delay or nonperformance is excused under Paragraph 40 (Excuse for Nonperformance or Delayed Performance) of

the Termination for Default Clause of this contract, liquidated damsges shall not e due the texritory. The contractor remains
liable for damages caused other than by delay (GFR Section 6-101-09.1).

42. PHYSICAL LIABILITY: - I it becomes necessary for the Vendor, either as principal, agent or employee, to enter upon the
premises or property of the Government of Guam in order to construct, crect, inspect, make delivery or remove property
hereunder, the Vendor hercby covenants and agrees to take, use, provide and make all proper, nocessary and sufficient
muﬁmnwwpmﬁmm&mdmmmm«dmgammmmm
during the progresa of the work herein covered, and to be responsible for, and to indenmify and save harmiess the Government
of Guam from the payment of all sums of moncy by reason of all or any such accidents, injuries or damages that may occur
uponoraboutsuchwo:k,mdﬁmu,pmlﬁuandhuincmmdfmwbywmoﬂ!wviohﬁomdmymﬁmﬁdm,
regulations, or the laws of Guam or the United States, while the work is in progress. Contractor will carry insurance to .
hdmmﬁfymeGommmOmeapMmychimﬁrbu,dmgeminjwyhmymwmﬁmgmofﬂg
perfommceoftheCm«mmlmmmﬁhmww&mmmem,mimw

failure of any equipment used by the contractor or his cmployees or agents, and shall provide cestificates of such insurance to
Government of Guam when required.

43. CONTACT FOR CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION: If your firm receives a contract as a result of this

Solicitation, ples__)
designate a person whom we may contact for prompt administration. .

Name: \@V'”\\W " . | Title: _@‘LMAQ M-G‘w\q-'{go\
- ! - Telephone: 'U//( . ‘tlc'\.‘-ﬂ(;‘

CSA Porm 112 Reviesd 385
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/6114 0l tha Govarniment Code of Giam, All paymants for this

GOVERNMENT OF GUAM

[N

BID FORMS: Eachbiddershalibe provided with two (2) sats of Solicitation forms. Additional copies may be provided
uponrequest, Bidders raquesting additiong! copies of said fornis will bé charged per page in accordance with Saction
purpose shall be by cash, certitied check or monay

,.a
2t

 orderand shall be made payable'to'the General Services Agency (EO 86-24);

b) *: Each biddar shall firnish the information reju

- PREPARATIONSOFBIDS: = = oo = o |
< #): :Biddersare reciUiradto‘aiaminathq'q rawings; spacification’s, schedule, and all instructions. Failure to do s0 will

- - . be atbidders'risk: -

. nation fequired by the Soficitation. Tha bidder shall sign the Solicitation and
"print or typa‘his name on thé Schiedule.” Erasures or other chariges must b'initialad by, the person signing the
bid. Bids signed by an agent areto be accompanied by évidencs of his authority unless such evidence has been
previously furnished to the issuing office. . R w o e S
€} Unitpricatorsach unitoffarad shallbe’shown a_nd"spchjp.ripa‘§haj]l,.inc‘|udb,pad5ing unless otherwise spacified.
 Atotal'shill b entered in the'amourit collimn of the Sghedula for each #émicfiered. In case of discrepancies
' - batwser a unit price’and extandsd pfice; the unit price will be presiimed to'be correct.” T :

_d) '=Bids*fdr'=‘suppliés-br"s"er'\’licés"'othé'_r‘rt‘han"thb@q:sp’é‘cii_iad will not ba considerad.

®) Time, if stated s o number of days, means calendar days and will Inclugie Saturdays,

_ r ) i . e Sundays, and hofidays
beginning the day after the Issudnce of o Notice to Proceed. “Time siated eriding on o Saturday, Sunday or
Government of Guam legal holiday will end af the close of the next businéss_day; L Lo

| éXPuNAﬂON.TO. BIDDERS: Aﬁy akplanalion desired by a bidder regarding the méaniqg or interpretation of the

Salicitation, drawings, spacilications, etc., must'be submitied in writing and with sutficient time'allowad for a written

~1eply to reactiallbidders before the submission of their bidi: :Oral explanatiofis orinstructions givan before the award

- of-the contract will not be. binding; “Any infarmation g
~.-furaished 1o-all prospective:bidders in writin

iven'to a'prospactive bidder concerning'a Solicitation wili be
9 as.an amendmant o the Solicitation if such'infarmatidn'is necessary
for bidders in submitting bids on the Solicitation or i the lack of such'information would be prejudicial to uninformed
biddaers. ‘ ] o g e T -

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF AMENDMENTS TO SOLICITATIONS: Receipt 4f an amandmient to a Solicitation by

. abidder must be acknowledgad by signing an ackn‘owledgamdrit}nf’recélbk'Of‘!he=amen’dmjui1t; Stich acknowledge-

d) Samples or descriptive.fitarature-should not ba submittad unless'it is'required on this Sol

' b} In connection with any discount off

DOAFIMMMW.

..- FAILURE TO SUBMIT BID;. if-no bid js to bo sub

ment must be received prior to tha hour and datle spacified for.raceipt 6t'bids. - -

SUBMISSION OF BIDS: : A o ‘

2} -Bids and modifications thareof shall be enclosed in sealsd anvelopes and'gddre_g_)seq to the office specified in
the Solicitation. The bidder shall show the hour and date spacifiad in the Solicitation for recaipt, the Solicitation
numbar,-and the:name-and address of the bidder on the face of the énvelops, _ o

b) Telegraphic bids will not be considared unless authorized by tha Solicltation. Howevar, bids may ba modified

or withdrawn by written ortelagraphic notice, provided such notice is raceived prior to the hour and date specified
for receipt.(ses paragraph 6 of theseinstructions). - ST C

€) Samples of items, when raquired, must b submitied within the time specified, unless otherwise spacified by the
Government, at no expanse to the Government; M.notdestroyed by tasting, samples will be returned at bidder's

 requestand:axpense, unless:otharwise spacified by the Solicitation.”- = - -~ T '

_ icitation. "Regardless

of any altempt by a bidder 1o condition the bid, unsolicited samples or descriptive litarature wili not be examined

Or laslad at the biddar's risk, and will not be deemed to vary.any of the Provisions of this Solicitation.

mitted, do not return the Sclicitation unless otherwise spacified. A
letter or postcard shall be.sent1o the issuing office advising whether futire Solicitations tor the type of supplies or
services coveredby this Solicitation are desired. :

LATE BID, LATE WITHDRAWALS, AND LATE MODIFICATIONS:

a} Detinitlon: Any bid received after the time and date set for recaipt of bids is late. Any withdrawal or modification

of abid received after the time and date set for opaning of bids atthe place designated for opening is late (Guam
Procurement. Regulations Section 3-202.11.1 b : . T '

b). Treatment: No late bid, |ate modification, ot late withdrawal will be considered unless received before contract
. award, and the bid, modification, or withdrawal would have been timely but for the action or inaction of territorial
. personnal.diractly serving the procuremant aclivity (Guam Procurement Regilations Sectich 3-202. 1 1.2).

DISCOUNTS: : = )

a) ;,Np_lgé__it'hal_anding.,tha;.tag,!ha,t‘aprompt payment discounts may ba olfered, such offer will.not ba considared in

avaluating bids for award unless cthsrwise spscified in ihia-Soilciiation. Fiowever, offered discounts wilLba taken
. i payment is mada withii the discourt period, even though not censiderad intha evaliation of bids,

erad, time will be computed from date of delivery and acceptance of the.
supplies to the destination as indicated in the purchase order or contract. Payment is deemed 10 be made for

the purpase of earning the discount on the date of mailing of the Government check.

GOVERNMENT FURNISHED PROPERTY: No ma

tarial, labor or facilities will be furnishad by the Government
unless otherwise provided for in the Solicitation. : :
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10.

11,

12.

13.

SELLERS' INVOICES: Invoices shall ba prepared and submitied in quadruplicate (one copy 'shall be marked
~original”) uniess otherwise speciiied. Invaices shall be “certifled true sand correct” and shall contain tha following
information: Contract and order nuimber:(if any}; tem numbars, description of supplias or services, sizes, quantities,
unit prices, and extanded total. Bill of lading number and weight of shipment will be shown for shipments madeon
Governmant bilis ot lading.

RECEIPT, OPENING AND RECORDING OF BIDS: Bids and modifications shallbe publicly cpenedinthe presence
of one'ormore witnesses, atthe time, date, and place designated inthe Invitation forBids. The name of eachbidder,
the bid price, and such other information as is deemed approptiate by tha Procuremant Officer, shall be read aloud
and recorded, or otherwise made available. Tha names and addresses of required witnessas shall be recorded at
the opening. The opened bids shall be available for publicinspection excepttothe extentthe bidder designatestrade
secrats or othar proprietary data fo ba confidantial as set forth in accordance with Saction 12, below. .Material so
designated shall accompany the bid and shall be readily separable fromthe bid in arder to facifitate public inspection
of the non-confidential portion of the bid. Prices,, makes and madals or catalogue numbers of the #ems offered,
deliveries, and terms of payrent shali be publicly available attha time of-bid opening regardiess of any designation

to'the contrary (Guam Procurement Regulations Section 3-202.12.2).

CONFIDENTIAL DATA: The Procurement Officer shall examine ihe bids to detarmine tho. validity.of any requests

or nandisclosure of trade secrets and other proprietary data identified in.writing. | the parties do not agree as 1o

 tha disclosure of data, the Procurament Officer shall inform the biddars in writing what portions of the bid will be

disclosad andthat, unidssthe Biddors protest under Chapter 9ofthe uam Procurement Act (P.L. 16:124),the bids’
will be so disclosed. The bids shall be opened 1o public inspection subjact 16 any. continuing prohibition on the

- disclosure of confidential'data (Guam Procurement Regulations Section.3-202.12.3).

MULTI-STEP SEALED BIDDING:

a) lhisdefinedasa two-phase process consisting of a technical{irst-phase composed of ane ar morg steps in
which bidders submit unpricad technical offers 1o b evaluated by the territory, and asecond-phase in which
those biddars whose technical offers are determined o be acceptable during the first-phase have their priced
bids considered. 1t is designed to obtain the benefits of competitive sealed bidding by award of a contract to
the lowest responsiva, responsible bidder, and atthe samatime obtained the benetits of the compatitive sealed
proposals procedura throughthe solicitation of wachnical offers.and the conduct of discussionsta evaluate and

' detefriine the acceptability of technical offars.. ... ) : ‘ o

b)  ‘ln addition o the requirements set forth in the General Terms and Conditions and the Spacial provisions, the
{allowing applies: -
1) only unpriced technical offers are requested in the first phase;

2) priced bids will be considerad anly in the second phase and,only from hidders whose unpriced tachnical
offers are found acceptabld in tha first phase; - : S

9) the criteria to be used in the evaluation are thosa spacified in the Special Provisions and the Genaral
Terms and Conditions; '

4) thetarritary, tothe extent the Prpcur,ementOﬂicerﬁ_nds necessary, may conduct oralor written discussion
* of tha unpriced technical offers; ' ' :

5) thebidders, may designate those portions pf the u'npricad\téchnical offers which contain trade secrets or
other proprietaty data which are to ramain.confidential; and, ' .

6) 'ltids’h,rvica;;b’e’ing_pr,o‘gu__rggl'shall:lbq furnished generally in accordance with the bidder's techﬁical offeras
found ta be finally acceptable and shall moeet the requitements of the Invitation for Bids.

‘c) . RECEIPT AND HANDLING OF UNPRICED TECHNICAL OFFERS. :

Unpriced technical oHers shall nat be opanad publicly, but shallbe opaned in front of two or more procurement
officials. Such offers shall notbe disclosad to unauthorized-persons. Bidders may.request nondisclosure of
trade socrets and other proprietary data identified in wriling... : :

d) EVALUATION.OF UNPRICED TECHNICAL OFFERS. o :
The unpriced technical offars submitted by bidders-shall be evaluated solaly in accordance with the criteria
set {orth inthe Invitation for. Bids. - The unpriced technical offers shall be categorized as:
1) acceptable; ' : o
2) potentially accaptable, that is, reascnably susceptible of being made acceptable; or
3) unacceptable. Tha Procurement:Officer shali tacord in writing the basis for finding an otfer unacceplable
and mgke it part of the procurement file. : R A

- The Procurement Officer may initiate Phase Two of the procedure f,inthe Procurement Officer's opinion, there
are sufficient acceptable unpricad technica! offars to.assure effective price compatition:in:the second phasa
‘without technical discussions. . f the Procurement Officer finds such is not the cass, the Procurement Gfticer
shallissue an amendmenttothe Invitationfor Bids or engageintechnica! discussions as setforth in Subsaction

3-202.20.5 of this Section. ‘ ‘
e) Upon 't31_o complstion of Phase One, the Procurament Officer shall invita each acceptabla bidder to submit a
price-bid.: “Adpon. submission-of pricas, tho Procurement. Officer-shall prapare the final-evalustion and.

. reconsidaration for.the Chiaf Procurament Officer's approval.

P

Page 19 of 19
¢




* -
s ' past 1 o9 pamm

| | Ry N
?; . SAYIRINENT &F aval . : 10,/57 /' .‘Odﬂ-/'f

ABSTRACT OF BIDS | ”
i - == ,, .
!t-ltll 1 m = - . : -~ | ’ . X7

For f»i‘\; Fequrpment  Cb 4 . Lw - QQ
S atecns DealnfleV

(A
A\
CinlA OZ&AM/ ' -Céow&.e_. 'o—u “'%‘-‘-é:’(“jazf*g < 4 l/é /L—l, ..263/? 7
‘//; o { —/ : 1 !,. [ W TS " {
1 r WO i 4K £/ e fo7 %
. Coileescsiv ofg LKl 4 ]
_\_ 2 ,;_.:..:4'_’ QA-&JM./- H
‘5720"’5’&“_7 O A /671 y) o

— fers - i N g I
" e cil] Pkl Aok .
J/L@J" Ay (o / Aa 5 . J .LQ/ o
&: _beHW___H-_(__)..\_,..SE}ANQLLQﬁ&__ S22l —1- | R
T e ' RS PR it |
f—b " LOBIY RSUPIEI SIS
4.0 L)

K

. » ; T 3
| ‘ 1N REEPONEAAL EEOER fiee o,
— ’ R — "-,..'.'."-.._—d--u e




rags t ot
IWITATION MUMARER

rasis

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINIETRATION
GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY
GOVERNMENT OF GUAM

ABSTRACT OF BIDS {Continved)

4

3

=] 3.

b,

VpcdorA7 )

los

S

N

=7
heut (2217 ¢30.) f(:%ag@y
AN

.*:.‘T. ' (]
_ — 10

NEYA Lo Nagd cr.ifo

4

THIS LINE FOR OFTIONAL USK: INDICATE SNIPPING POINT, LAST PRICK AWARDES, LOT, KTE.

; g
fl f
; {
. o



e i T e
é ABSTRACT OF BIDS ' ,5; /3 br | J0. 00 A4
mipDER 5 m - = ) .
=N &) |7 EXT
. £ ’ ~ ol o r O - ,7?{.0.9
e—vaméu.z-'v / Sli - - e 7./ - .
BMQLAM\) 4& L . , /
" | apticact  ieatosit . & Srtse., Aok Apllys /43 /02
/ ool e“‘z, 1 /.” e & ' ﬁ
ez - Coolecsiso odd e 07 .
— (42T F == ,-,'_ Qer
Kj?zaa/r,é—--y .'/ el P 3 7
‘ < u.f &MM 07
INaFerey 4 2 o7
e i Dpocosbs P z |
.‘__ . —_—
PROVAL OF AWARD (8)_ (Siasjel and Poisnie) siraind shove) -
RASIS FOR AWARD
_““
N ] 7 T )
"I AN [Dastesion )




rARE | B0
1ITATION MUMITE

ranit

DEFARTMENT OF ADMIMIETRATION
QENENAL SERVICES ABINCY
SOVERMMENT OF StJAM

ABSTRACT OF BIDS (Continued)

el 3/ X7 &/

Vol

A

(L2t] /7795 (42,1299 | soad 50l 99210

r)
THIS LIME FOR OPTIONAL USE; INOICATE SHIPPINE PONIT, LASY PRLICE AWANDED, LUY, ETC.



3 =

fare”
F .
| rtep cumne GENERAL SERVIBS AGENCY  vishae w.cru
§ {(Ahensian Setbision Hinirat) Lt. Governor
§ Department of Administration '
Lourdes M. Perez Government of Guam Joseph C. Manibusan

s ) rl:lrectto rf Administrati 148 Route I Marine Drive, Piti, Guam 96915 Deputy Director
. i__jartmento ministration Tel: (671)475-1707 thru 1729/Fax Nos: {671)472. 421:/475-1716 Department of Administratiox

September 19, 2007

Memorandum
To: Chief Procurement Officer )
From: Angel Cruz-Wusstig, Buyer II
Subject: Analysis on Invitation for Bid No. GSA-PAG-07-006 for Purchase of
Five (5) 11,000 1bs; Two (2) 16 0001bs, One (1) 20,000 Ibs; One (1)
40 000 Ibs FORK TRUCKS

Invitation for Bid No. GSA-PAG-07-006 was officially announced and advertised in the
Pacific Daily News on July 12, 2007. Five (5) prospective bidders expressed their
interest by acknowledging receipt of the bid package.

The bid was officially opened and read at 10:00am on July 26, 2007. Two (2) bidders
submitted their price, namely: Far East Equipment Co., LLC and Morrico Equipment
LLC. :
Far East Equipment Company offers the following:

Item No. 1.1 Five (5) 11,0001bs. Fork Trucks: NO BID

Item No. 1.2 Two (2) 16,0001bs. Fork Trucks: NO BID

Item No. 1.3 Three (3) 20,0001bs. Fork Trucks: NO BID

Item No. 1.4 One (1) 40,0001bs. Fork Truck: $227,830.80-KalmarDCE 180-6
*QOption for Item No. 1.4 One (1) 40,0001bs. Fork Truck: $286,610.40-KalmarDCE
200-12

S

Morrico Equipment LLC offers the following:
Item No. 1.1 Five (5) 11,000lbs. Fork Trucks: Unit Cost $44,799.00 X 5 ea.

=$223.995.00

Item No. 1.2 Two (2) 16,0001bs. Fork Trucks: CANCELLED
An INCREASE on Item 1.3 One (1) 20,0001bs.to
Three (3) ea. 20,0001bs. Fork Trucks

Item No. 1.3 Three (3) 20,000Ibs. Fork Trucks: Unit Cost $147 799.00 X 3 ea.

=$443,397.00
Item No. 1.4 One (1) 40,0001bs. Fork Truck: Unit Cost $252,999.00

Grand Total of $920,391.00

D Page 1 of 2
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fors”

| Fel) P Camasho GENERAL SEHV@S AGENCY  Michaet W. Crus,

; (Ahensian Setbision Hinirat) Lt. Gavernor
Department of Administrati '

_ L g P L3 11 nistration

:1 oml-)di::x)rl'erez Government of Guam Joseph C, Manibusan

148 Route { Marine Drive, Piti, Guam 96915 Deputy Director

L\_)artment of Adminjstration Tel: (671)475-1707 thru 1729/Fax Nos: (671)472-4217/475-1716 Department of Administratio

Based on my analysis and the approval from Port Authority of Guam Equipment
Evaluation Committee along side with General Services Agency, I recommend Bid
NO. GSA-PAG-07-006 be awarded to Morrico Equipment LLC for all Fork Lift
Truck Equipments, Five (5) 11,0001bs.; Three (3) 20,000lbs.; One (1) 40,0001bs in the
total amount of $920,391.00, to be the lowest most responsive and responsible bidder.

Your approval is therefore solicited. W % WMO
Angel Cruz-Wusstig

Buyer I

CONCURRED BY:

) o fideo T W sl

() Claudia S. Acfalle
_, Chief Procurement Officer

Page 2 of 2

COMMITTED TO EXCELLENCE



( PPLIES &
G5 cQUIPMENT

FCN-2-2-166 (APPROVED 10/66)

INDICATE METHOD BY NUMBER
03_.0THER CONTRACTUAL SERVICES

XX MISCELLANEQUS

MATERIALS

" PURCHASE ORDER

PORT AUTHORITY OF GUAM
1026 CABRAS HIGHWAY

PURCHASE ORDER

No. 1044 os

THIS NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL
PACKAGES AND PAPERS PERTAINING
TO THIS ORDER

Cd.—ctor: Please supgly promptly the above arlicles or services,
All zerrassardence peraining to this ordar including inveices, shipping

dac.mzrig and packages must bear the Purchase Ordernumber shown above.

oo Ay Ers

H

zida for bibing and shigping instructions.

SUITE 201 DATE
ID # 98-0020236 PITI, GUAM 96925 09/27/07
REQUISITION NUMBER ACTIVITY . ALLOTMENT
8461 ON Port Authority of Guam 50.2010.FORKLIFT
TO CONSIGNEE, DESTINATION AND MARKING
' 0 E PMENT 1. 3 .
s li‘ggkgm I%gin LG .H Port Authority of Guam
L P 1026 Cabras Highway
L TAMUNING, GUAM 96913 Suite 201
E ATTN: MR. FRANK FLORES g P G 6995
: TEL# 649-1946, FAX#649-1947 i, Guam 969
INVITATION NO. CONTRACT NO. TIME FOR DELIVERY EXPIRING DISCOUNT TERMS
IFBPAGO7-006 IFBPAGO7-006 120 DAYS to 280 DAYS
|oeLvERY F.OB. SHIPFING POINT SHIP VIA B.L. NO.
TEM NO, ARTICLES OR SERVICES QUANTITY UNIT | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1. 11,000 1LBS. FORKLIFT TRUCKS, 5 ea. $223,995.00
@$44,799.00 each (120 Days to 180 Days)
2. 20,000 LBS. FORKLIFT TRUCKS, 3 ed. $443,397.00
@$147,799.00 each (180 Days to 280 Days)
[D 40,000 LBS. FCRKLIFT TRUCKS,
\ @$252,999.00 each (180 Days to 280 Days) 1 ea. $252,999.00
NCTE TO VENDOR:
1). THE CHIEF PROCUREMENT OFFICER WILL CONDUCT [AN AUDIT P ODICALLY TO
DETERMINE COMPLIANCE WITH GUAM PROCUREMENT [LAW.
2). THE GOVERNMENT OF GUAM WILL NOT BE RESPONSIBLE FOR UNA ORIZED SERVICE(s)
OR PURCHASE(s).
3). ALL LATE DELIVERIES ARE SUBJECT TO LIQUIDATED DAMAGES NURSU. TO SECIION
6101(9) OF THE GPR.
NOTE: All amounts due this Purchase Order may He off set fdr monies due the
- - Government of- Guam—inclusive of but not limited [to taxes; fees, gnd fétufﬁ%d"" T
checks plus fees, interest or other damages, pepalties and atto s fees)
after failure to pay according to law. .
AUTHORITY GAR: SECTION: 3109 *k&k PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS ON FINAL
SECTION: TRANSPORTATION DIVISION @ 477-5931/35 DELIVERY| OR ON RECEIPT
EXTS. 411/227 MR. RAY SANTOS OF INVOICE WHICHEVER I3 LATER
'FVA,‘_,L@ o VLD g‘ﬁ‘*’?“‘"""(‘
"Commonwealth Now" Lo ' Zﬂ- l_(:\
Certified Funds Available
Authorized Certitying Officer Not to exceed the amount below.
Oﬁl_gj;*iAL ESA} TOTALs920,391.00

i Bdoo £ Lo

r

SIGNATURE

CLAUDIA S. ACFALLE, CHIEF PROCUREMENT OFFICER

NAME

TITLE

ORIGINAL -

YEMDOR'S COPY




; P.O. box FC, Agana, Guam 96910
U | Tek 477-8836 - 8 * Telefax 724017

Accountability . Impartiality * Competenae . Openness *  Value

BID STATUS

Date: ocT 01, 2007

FAR EAST EQULPMENT CO. LLC
P.0. BOX 10838

TAMUNING GUAM 96931

BID INVITATION NO.: Gsa-pAG-07-006 OPENED: _24 aUGUST 2007 .

DESCRIPTION:__ 5(EA.) 11,0001bs 2(EA) 16,0001bs 1(EA) 20,0001bs 1(EA) 40,0001bs
FORK L1FT TRPJCKS

The following is the result of the rbove-—mentioned bid. Refer to the items checked below.
[ ) cCancelled (in its entirety), or partially cancelled duse to:

( ) insufficient funds:
( ) Change of ffications; or
( ) Insufficient number of bidders.

xxx  Rejected due to: ]‘ ©
( ) Late submission of bid;
( ) No bid security or insufficient bid security amount submithad as required by
Section 11 of the General Terms and Conditions;
( ) Not meeting the delivery requirement as stated in the IFB;
(xx)  Non-— with the specifications; For Option 1.
( ) inability to p e future maintenance and services to the equipment;
(xx;) High price; or [For option 2.
(o  Others

1. Did not mdet minimum horsepower requirements. Minimum horsepower
required 55 per specifications 230hp-Far East 220hp

2. Did not meet fork dimensions. As per specification Length of for 96"
Far East &47". '

[}TJ Bid is recommended for award to:

MORRLCO EGUL1PMENT LLC 1N THE TOTAL AMOUNT OF 920,391.00.

REMARKS:

YHANE YOU FOR PARTICIPATING TN THIS BID. PLEASE HAVE YOUR AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE COME: BY OUR OFFICE TO PICK UP THE ORIGIEAL BID STATUS AND BID
GUARANTEE DEPOSIT. | SI YU'DS MA'ASE

cruval /M..;w',r b b e Flelil

7 CLAGDIA S. ACFRRLE
Chief Procurement Officer

o



LY

GENERAL SER VIUMGENC Y  Michael W. Cruz,

(Ahensian Setbision Hinirat) Lt. Governor -
' Department of Administration .
Lourdes M. Perez Government of Guam . Joseph C. Manibusan

, irector . 148 Route 1 Marine Drive, Piti, Guam 96915 Deputy Director
Dej..rtment of Administration Tel: (671)475-1707 thru 172%T ax Nos: (671)472- -4217/475-1716 Department of Administration

Felix P Camacho
’ Governor

August 24, 2007

Memorandum Om?!g‘j %ﬁf\‘f-f’b
§§ % 5‘?’ i, g}

§ h‘“ @, Pt p‘ 5] ;’i’\ﬁ
H R B Bn § W B
To: General Manager,
Port Authority of Guam
From: Angel Cruz-Wusstig, Buyer II

Subject: Approval of Bid Specifications GSA-PAG-07-006 for Purchase of Five
(5) 11,000 1bs; Two (2) 16,000 1bs; One (1) 20,000 lbs;: One (1) 40,000
Ibs FORK TRUCKS

Hafa Adai! Attached is a copy of specifications submitted by Far East Equipment
Co.,LLc and Morrico Equipment LLC. Please review and evaluate the specifications
provided by the bidders and concur below if all required specifications are met. If
the specifications of a bidders is not acceptable, please provide a justification why it
is not acceptable. We would appreciate your response no later than Friday, August
31, 2007 in order for GSA to make an award on this bid, expeditiously.

@,

If you have any questions regarding this matter, please call An ) Cruz-Wusstlg,
at 475-1708. ’J

Claudla S Acfalle
Chief Procurement Officer

Meets Specifications DA ;/;ﬂ Bg?-b [78EPC 7

Non-Compliance of Specifications [ ] o ‘/9/ /7,07
9/17/27
qft1/07
Remarks: QPETEE 7wp(2) (4,000 A8 Avo /«:/e/mt—sc 08, £PPLBE
7O HneElm) Lntris. -

Non-Compliance of Specifications 2(]
— ~ Far East Equipment Co.,LLC does nbot' meet specifications
K, | for line item 1.4 Option l.please see attached justifications.

CONCURRED BY:

Kenneth Tagawa

General Manager, Port Authority of Guam

Joaquin Cruz, Deputy General Manager, Port Authority of Guam

COMMITTED TO EXCELLENCE



